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Natasha Hamilton joins The Real Housewives of Cheshire

British pop royalty turns reality queen

Series 16 of the hit reality show is set to launch on ITVBe and the ITVX
on Monday 20th March at 9pm

Natasha Hamilton has officially announced that she will be joining The Real
Housewives of Cheshire line-up for Series 16.

The ladies are joined by new Housewife and British Pop Royalty, Atomic Kitten’s
Natasha Hamilton, who wastes no time in navigating a new marriage, surprise
baby news and launching her solo career. Returning for Series 16 are Seema
Malhotra, Hanna Kinsella, Rachel Lugo, Lystra Adams, Sheena Lynch, Lauren
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Simon, Nicole Sealey, along with Guest Housewives Katie Alex, new girl Paige
Chohan and beloved alum Tanya Bardsley!

Friendships are changed forever, relationships are pushed to breaking point, and
families are tested, as the ladies of Cheshire experience life-changing moments
this season. As ever, there are also plenty of laughs when the girls hit Lisbon for a
girls’ trip, go head-to-head on the dodgeball court and channel their energy at a
memorable women’s retreat! The Real Housewives of Cheshire return as the
British faction of this globally successful franchise to share their glamour, guts
and grace with the world!

Natasha commented: “I am thrilled to be joining the Real Housewives of Cheshire
family. There are so many exciting things happening for me this year, including
my pregnancy and releasing my new music as a solo artist, and I felt the show
would really help me tell my story. Viewers will get behind the scenes access into
my life, an all- access pass as such, into my life as Natasha Hamilton – a devoted
mother, businesswoman, and solo artist. This new chapter feels exciting!”

The 11x60’ series is produced by Monkey, which is part of Universal International
Studios, a division of Universal Studio Group. The series will once again be
followed by the Reunion show, hosted by number one #RHOCheshire fan and TV
presenter Brian Dowling. David Granger and Natasha Bardusco are Executive
Producers for Monkey. NBCUniversal Formats, also a division of Universal Studio
Group, distributes The Real Housewives franchise globally.
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